BEAC
PUBLIC HEARING

LOCAL ADOPTION OF THE LATEST
CALIFORNIA BUILDING STANDARDS CODE
AND UNIFORM HOUSING CODE

AUGUST 15, 2016

PREPARED BY

SUSTAINABLE
LONGBEACH

B DevecopmemServices

Department of Development Services, Building and Safety Bureau and Code Enforcement Division
Fire Department, Fire Prevention Bureau Version: 08/15/2016
City Manager, Office of Sustainability



THE 2017 PROPOSED AMENDMENTS TO THE LONG BEACH MUNICIPAL CODE

TABLE OF CONTENT

SECTION NUMBER | TITLE PAGE
18.40.010 Adoption 3
18.40.020 Application 4
18.40.030 Amendments to the adopted code 5
18.40.040 Sections, chapters or appendices deleted from the adopted code 6
18.40.050 Amend CBC Section 201.4—Terms not defined 7
18.40.060 Amend CBC Section 302.1—Classification 8
18.40.070 Amend CBC Section 1603.1.9—Systems and components requiring 9
special inspections for seismic resistance
18.40.080 Amend CBC Section 1612.3—Establishment of flood hazard areas 10
18.40.090 Amend CBC Section 1612.5—Flood hazard documentation 11
18.40.100 Add CBC Section 1613.5.3—Minimum distance for building separation 12
18.40.110 Add CBC Section 1613.5.4—Modify ASCE 7 Section 12.2.3.1 Exception 13
3.
18.40.120 Add CBC Section 1613.5.2—Modify ASCE 7, Section 12.11.2.2.3 14
18.40.130 Add CBC Section 1613.7—Suspended ceiling 15
18.40.140 Amend CBC Section 1705.3—Concrete construction 17
18.40.150 Amend CBC Section 1705.12—Seismic resistance 18
18.40.160 Amend CBC Section 1704.6—Structural observations 19
18.40.170 Amend CBC Section 1707.1—Alternative test procedure 21
18.40.180 Amend CBC Section 1807.1.4—Permanent wood foundation systems 22
18.40.190 Amend CBC Section 1807.1.6— Prescriptive design of concrete and 23
masonry foundation walls
18.40.200 Amend CBC Section 1809.3—Stepped footings 24
18.40.210 Amend CBC Section 1809.7 and Table 1809.7— Prescriptive footings 26
for light-frame construction
18.40.220 Amend CBC Section 1809.12—Timber footings 28
18.40.230 Amend CBC Section 1810.3.2.4—Timber 29
18.40.240 Amend CBC Section 2304.12.5—Wood used in retaining walls and cribs 30
18.40.250 Add CBC Section 2305.4—Quality of nails 31
18.40.260 Add CBC Section 2305.5—Hold-down connectors 32
18.40.270 Amend CBC Section 2306.2—Wood-frame diaphragms 33
18.40.280 Amend CBC Section 2306.3—Wood-frame shear walls 35
18.40.290 Add CBC Section 2307.2—Wood-frame shear walls 38
18.40.300 Amend CBC Section 2308.6.8.1—Braced wall line support 40
18.40.340 Amend CBC Section 2304.10.1—Fastener requirements 41
18.40.350 Amend CBC Section 2308.6.9—Attachment of sheathing 42
18.65.010 Demolition of landmarks prohibited without building permit and funding 43
for replacement structure
21.15.025 Terms Not Defined 44
21.15.406.A Expiration 45
21.31.220.B4 Height limit — exceptions 46

Department of Development Services, Building and Safety Bureau and Code Enforcement Division
Fire Department, Fire Prevention Bureau
City Manager, Office of Sustainability

Version: 08/15/2016 2




THE 2017 PROPOSED AMENDMENTS TO THE LONG BEACH MUNICIPAL CODE

PROPOSED AMENDMENT:
Section 18.40.010 of the Long Beach Municipal Code is amended to read as follows:
18.40.010 - Adoption.

The City Council adopts and incorporates by reference as though set forth in full in this chapter the
20432016 Edmon of the Caln‘orma Building Code%neladmg%ppeadmes—@—#an@#bu@e*e&u&ng
0_(herein referred to as the “California

urldmg Code”) The Cahforma Buﬂdmg Code is Part 2 of the California Code of Regulations, Title 24,
also referred to as the California Building Standards Code. This part is based on the provisions of the
20422015 Edition of the International Building Code (medel—scedeherein referred to as the
‘International Building Code’) as developed by the International Code Council with necessary
California amendments._The following appendices of the California Building Code are included:
Appendices C and |. The following sections, chapters or appendices of the California Building Code
are deleted: Sections 101 through 116 of Chapter 1, Division 1I; and Appendices A, B. D, E, F, G, H,
J, K. Land M.

The adoption of the 2013-Edition—of the-California-Building-Code{hereinreferred-to-as-“California

Building Code™} is subject to the changes, amendments and modifications to said code as provided in
this chapter, and certain provisions of the Long Beach Municipal Code, which shall remain in full force
and effect as provided in this title. Such codes and code provisions shall constitute and be known as
the Long Beach Building Code. A copy of the California Building Code, printed as code in book form,
shall be on file in the oO0ffice of the City Clerk.

RATIONALE:

Administrative changes to reference the latest edition of the State’'s code. State law requires that local
jurisdictions adopt the 2016 Edition of the California Building Code by January 1, 2017. This amendment
adopts the latest edition of the California Building Code and makes minor editorial changes to reflect that
certain non-mandatory sections, chapters, and/or appendices are either included or deleted as part of the
code adoption.

FINDINGS:

Local Administrative Clarification — Amendment is necessary for local administrative clarification, and
does not modify a Building Standard pursuant to Sections 17958, 17958.5 and 17958.7 of the California
Health and Safety Code.

Department of Development Services, Building and Safety Bureau and Code Enforcement Division Page 1 of 1
Fire Department, Fire Prevention Bureau Draft Version: 08/02/2016
City Manager, Office of Sustainability

2



THE 2017 PROPOSED AMENDMENTS TO THE LONG BEACH MUNICIPAL CODE

PROPOSED AMENDMENT:
Section 18.40.020 of the Long Beach Municipal Code is amended to read as follows:
18.40.020 — Application.

The provisions of the meodel-coede-{the-International Building Code}, which are incorporated into the
California Building Code, are applicable to all occupancy groups and uses regulated by the medel
eode|nternational Building Code. The amendments made by the State agencies to the mode!
codelnternational Building Code and incorporated into the California Building Code are applicable
only to those occupancies or uses that the State ageneyagencies making the amendments isare
authorized to regulate, as listed in Chapter 1, Division | of the California Building Code. The Building
and Safety Bureau shall erlyadopt and enforce thesesuch provisions and amendments made by the
following State agencies:

Ceoede-The California RJ as specified in éection 1.2 of the California
Building Code and identified in the Matrix Adoptigh Tables under the acronyms BSC and BSC-
CG.

A

B. The Department of Housing and, Corimunity Development {(HCD)-as specified in Section 1.8 of
the California Building Code_and Ydentified in the Matrix Adoption Tables under the acronyms
HCD 1 and HCD 1-AC.

f the State Fire Marshal (SEM)-as specified in Section 1.11 of the California Building
Cade and identified in the Matrix Adoption Tables under the acronym SFM.

RATIONALE?

This amendment makes minor editorial changes to reflect the state agencies and the applicable
provisions or amendments that will be adopted and enforced by the City.

FINDINGS:

Local Administrative Clarification — Amendment is necessary for local administrative clarification, and

does not modify a Building Standard pursuant to Sections 17958, 17958.5 and 17958.7 of the California
Health and Safety Code.

Department of Development Services, Building and Safety Bureau and Code Enforcement Division Page 1 of 1
Fire Department, Fire Prevention Bureau Draft Version: 08/02/2016
City Manager, Office of Sustainability



THE 2017 PROPOSED AMENDMENTS TO THE LONG BEACH MUNICIPAL CODE

PROPOSED AMENDMENT:

Section 18.40.030 of the Long Beach Municipal Code is deleted as follows:

RATIONALE:

The language regarding sections, chapters or appendices to be amended and/or modified in the CBC has
been relocated to and incorporated with the LBMC Se 18.40.010. This section is no longer required.
FINDINGS:

Local Administrative Clarification — Ame epbyis necessary for local administrative clarification, and

does not modify a Building Standard p a Sections 17958, 17958.5 and 17958.7 of the California
Health and Safety Code.

Department of Development Services, Building and Safety Bureau and Code Enforcement Division Page 1 of 1
Fire Department, Fire Prevention Bureau Draft Version: 08/02/2016
City Manager, Office of Sustainability

a!



THE 2017 PROPOSED AMENDMENTS TO THE LONG BEACH MUNICIPAL CODE

PROPOSED AMENDMENT:

Section 18.40.040 of the Long Beach Municipal Code is deleted as follows:

RATIONALE:

The language regarding sections, chapters or appendigés to be deleted from the CBC has been relocated
to and incorporated with the LBMC Section 18.40 is section is no longer required.

FINDINGS:

Local Administrative Clarification — Ame

: ent is necessary for local administrative clarification, and
does not modify a Building Standard pursig

o Sections 17958, 17958.5 and 17958.7 of the California

Health and Safety Code.
Department of Development Services, Building and Safety Bureau and Code Enforcement Division Page 1 of 1
Fire Department, Fire Prevention Bureau Draft Version: 08/02/2016

City Manager, Office of Sustainability

2



THE 2017 PROPOSED AMENDMENTS TO THE LONG BEACH MUNICIPAL CODE

PROPOSED AMENDMENT:

Section 18.40.050 of the Long Beach Municipal Code is amended to read as follows:

18.40.050 — Amend CBC Section 201.4—Terms not defined.
Section 201.4 of the 26432016 Edition of the California Building Code is amended to read as follows:
201.4 Terms not defined. Where terms are not defined through the methods authorized by this
section, such terms shall have ordinarily accepted meanings such as the context implies. Webster's

Third New International Dictionary of the English Language, Unabridged, shall be considered as
providing ordinarily accepted meanings.

RATIONALE:

Administrative changes to reference the latest €
jurisdictions adopt the 2016 Edition of the C rnia Build

he State’s code. State law requires that local
g Code by January 1, 2017. This amendment

makes minor editorial changes to referen cific dictionary to be used for words not defined in the
code since the IBC does not have such ce.
FINDINGS:

Local Administrative Clarificatio
does not modify a Building Stang
Health and Safety Code

endment is necessary for local administrative clarification, and
d pursuant to Sections 17958, 17958.5 and 17958.7 of the California

Department of Development Services, Building and Safety Bureau and Code Enforcement Division Page 1 of 1
Fire Department, Fire Prevention Bureau Draft Version: 08/02/2016
City Manager, Office of Sustainability

~



THE 2017 PROPOSED AMENDMENTS TO THE LONG BEACH MUNICIPAL CODE

PROPOSED AMENDMENT:
Section 18.40.060 of the Long Beach Municipal Code is amended to read as follows:
18.40.060 — Amend CBC Section 302.1—Classification.

The last sentence in Section 302.1 of the 20432016 Edition of the California Building Code is
amended to read as follows:

Where a structure is proposed for a purpose that is not specifically provided for in this code or about
which there is any question, such structure shall be classified, as determined by the Building Official,
in the group that the occupancy most nearly resembles, according to the fire safety and relative
hazard involved.

RATIONALE:

Administrative changes to reference the latg
jurisdictions adopt the 2016 Edition of the £a
makes minor editorial changes to clarify

determination on the proposed occupah
provided for in the code.

edition ofthe State’s code. State law requires that local
ifofpia Building Code by January 1, 2017. This amendment
Hat” the Building Official is authorized to make the final
a building or structure where such use is not specifically

FINDINGS:
Local Administrative Clafificgti Amendment is necessary for local administrative clarification, and
does not modify a Buflging £ gard pursuant to Sections 17958, 17958.5 and 17958.7 of the California

Department of Development Services, Building and Safety Bureau and Code Enforcement Division Page 1 of 1
Fire Department, Fire Prevention Bureau Draft Version: 08/02/2016
City Manager, Office of Sustainability

8



THE 2017 PROPOSED AMENDMENTS TO THE LONG BEACH MUNICIPAL CODE

PROPOSED AMENDMENT:

Section 18.40.070 of the Long Beach Municipal Code is deleted as follows:

RATIONALE:

This existing amendment is no longer necessary.

FINDINGS:

is necessary for local administrative clarification, and
to Sections 17958, 17958.5 and 17958.7 of the California

Local Administrative Clarification — Al
does not modify a Building Standard p

Health and Safety Code.
Department of Development Services, Building and Safety Bureau and Code Enforcement Division Page 1 of 1
Fire Department, Fire Prevention Bureau Draft Version: 07/15/2016

City Manager, Office of Sustainability

9



THE 2017 PROPOSED AMENDMENTS TO THE LONG BEACH MUNICIPAL CODE

PROPOSED AMENDMENT:
Section 18.40.080 of the Long Beach Municipal Code is amended to read as follows:
18.40.080 — Amend CBC Section 1612.3—Establishment of flood hazard areas.

Section 1612.3 of the 20432016 Edition of the California Building Code is amended to read as
follows:

1612.3 Establishment of flood hazard areas. To establish flood hazard areas, the City shall adopt a
flood hazard map and supporting data. The flood hazard map shall include, at a minimum, areas of
special flood hazard as identified by the Federal Emergency Management Agency in an engineering
report entitled "The Flood Insurance Study for the City of Long Beach” dated July 6, 1998, as
amended or revised with the accompanying Floog/{@surance Rate Map (FIRM) and Flood Boundary
and Floodway Map (FBFM) and related suppOwing data along with any revisions thereto. The
adopted flood hazard map and supporting dgt4 arekereby adopted by reference and declared to be
part of this section.

RATIONALE:

Administrative changes to reference the ia
jurisdictions adopt the 2016 Editisr

edition of the State’s code. State law requires that local

does not modify
Health and Saf

Department of Development Services, Building and Safety Bureau and Code Enforcement Division Page 1 of 1
Fire Department, Fire Prevention Bureau Draft Version: 08/14/2016
City Manager, Office of Sustainability

| d



THE 2017 PROPOSED AMENDMENTS TO THE LONG BEACH MUNICIPAL CODE

PROPOSED AMENDMENT:
Section 18.40.090 of the Long Beach Municipal Code is amended to read as follows:
18.40.090 — Amend CBC Section 1612.5—Flood hazard documentation.

Section 1612.5 Items 1.1 and 2.1 of the 20432016 Edmon of the Cahfornla Bualdmg Code 4sare
amended by

2o read as follows

1.1 The elevation of the lowest floor, including the basement. as required by the lowest fioor elevation
inspection in_Subsection 18.07.050.A.3 of the Long Beach Municipal Code and for the final
inspection in Subsection 18.07.050.A.13 of the Long Beach Municipal Code.

2.1 The elevation of the bottom of the lowest hofizontal structural member as required by the lowest
floor elevation inspection in Subsection 1807.05Q.A.3 of the Long Beach Municipal Code and for
the final inspection in Subsection 18.07.450. A\L3\6>the Long Beach Municipal Code.

RATIONALE:

Administrative changes to reference the [ edition of the State’s code. State law requires that local
jurisdictions adopt the 2016 Editjen California Building Code by January 1, 2017. This amendment
i i ¢ appropriate reference to the City's Municipal Code for flood

Fire Department, Fire Prevention Bureau Draft Version: 08/02/2016

Department of Development Services, Building and Safety Bureau and Code Enforcement Division Page 1 of 1
City Manager, Office of Sustainability ,



THE 2017 PROPOSED AMENDMENTS TO THE LONG BEACH MUNICIPAL CODE

PROPOSED AMENDMENT:
Section 18.40.100 of the Long Beach Municipal Code is amended to read as follows:

18.40.100 — Add CBC Section 4643-61613.5.2—Minimum-distance-for-buildingStructural separation.

Section 4613:61613.5.2 is added to Chapter 16 of the 20432016 Edition of the California Building
Code to read as follows:

4613-61613.5.2 ASCE#—42-12:3Structural Separation. Modify ASCE 7 Section 12.12.3 Equation
12.12-1-ef Section42-12.-3to-read as foliows:

oy =Cy0... (12.12-1)

RATIONALE:

Administrative changes to reference thé
jurisdictions adopt the 2016 Edition of the

edition of the State’s code. State law requires that local
¥ornia Building Code by January 1, 2017. The inclusion of
the importance factor in this equation has the ufintended consequence of reducing the minimum seismic
separation distance for importaht facilittesysuch as hospitals, schools, police and fire stations from
adjoining structures. The propo .Wo prit-the importance factor from Equation 12.12-1 will ensure that a
safe seismic separation distance i

is‘orovided.

FINDINGS:

Local Geologic Con
modification

oqs — Amendment is necessary on the basis of a local geologic condition. The

Department of Development Services, Building and Safety Bureau and Code Enforcement Division Page 1 of 1
Fire Department, Fire Prevention Bureau Draft Version: 08/04/2016
City Manager, Office of Sustainability

12



THE 2017 PROPOSED AMENDMENTS TO THE LONG BEACH MUNICIPAL CODE

PROPOSED AMENDMENT:

Section 18.40.110 of the Long Beach Municipal Code is amended to read as follows:

18.40.110 — Add CBC Section 4643-71613.5.3—Medify ASCE-7-Section42.2.3.1-Exception-3Values for

vertical combinations.

Section 4643-71613.5.3 is added to Chapter 16 of the 20432016 Edition of the California Building
Code to read as follows:

4643-71613.5.3 —12:2:34; i Values for Vertical Combinations. Modify ASCE 7
Section 12.2.3.1 Exception 3 to-read-as follows:

3. Detached one and two family dwellings up to t tories in height of light frame construction.

RATIONALE:

Administrative changes to reference the I dition and section of the State’s code. State law requires
that local jurisdictions adopt the 2016/Edifiop” of the California Building Code by January 1, 2017.
Observed damages to one and two fa dwellings of light frame construction after the Northridge
Earthquake may have been partially attrib o vertical irregularities common to this type of occupancy
and construction. In an effort to~imprave qidlity of construction and incorporate lesson learned from
studies after the Northridge Ea ke, Ahe proposed modification to ASCE 7-10 Section 12.2.3.1
Exception 3 by limiting the numpb stories and height of the structure to two stories will significantly
minimize the impact of vertical irregdlarities and concentration of inelastic behavior from mixed structural
systems.

FINDINGS:

ogical Sonditions — Amendment is necessary on the basis of a local geologic condition.
Observed’ damayges| to one and two family dwellings of light frame construction after the Northridge
Earthquake Fve been partially attributed to vertical irregularities common to this type of occupancy
he proposed modification to limit mixed structural system to two stories is intended to
lity’of construction by reducing potential damages that may result from vertical irregularities of
the structural’system in buildings subject to high seismic load. The amendment makes modification and
changes to better limit personal injury and property damage as a result of seismic activity and to establish
criteria for repair of damaged property following a local emergency.

Department of Development Services, Building and Safety Bureau and Code Enforcement Division Page 1 of 1
Fire Department, Fire Prevention Bureau Draft Version: 08/05/2016
City Manager, Office of Sustainability

13



THE 2017 PROPOSED AMENDMENTS TO THE LONG BEACH MUNICIPAL CODE

PROPOSED AMENDMENT:
Section 18.40.120 of the Long Beach Municipal Code is amended to read as follows:

18.40.120 — Add CBC Section 4643-81613.5.4—Modify ASCE 7 -Section-12-4+-2.2.3Wood diaphragms.

Section 4643:81613.5.4 is added to Chapter 16 of the 20432016 Edition of the California Building
Code to read as follows:

1613-81613.5.4 ASGE-7-Seetion-12:-11-2:2-3Wood Diaphragms. Modify ASCE 7; Section 12.11.2.2.3
to-read-as follows:

12.11.2.2.3 Wood Diaphragms. In wood diaphragms, the continuous ties shall be in addition to the
diaphragm sheathing. Anchorage shall not be acegmplished by use of toe nails or nails subject to
withdrawal nor shall wood ledgers or framing be”u$ed in cross-grain bending or cross-grain tension.
The diaphragm sheathing shall not be considefed effective as providing ties or struts required by this
section.

1. The spacing of continuous ties'ghalbnot exceed 40 feet. Added chords of diaphragms may be
used to form subdiaphes to“transmit the anchorage forces to the main continuous

2. shear used to determine the depth of the subdiaphragm shall not
um diaphragm shear.
RATIONALE:
Administratj reference the latest edition and section of the State’s code. State law requires

that loca jorjs adopt the 2016 Edition of the California Building Code by January 1, 2017. A joint
Structiyal okps Association of Southern California, Los Angeles County and Los Angeles City Task
ed the performance of concrete and masonry construction with flexible wood diaphragm
failures afteg thé Northridge earthquake. It was concluded at that time that continuous ties are needed at
specified spacing to control cross grain tension in the interior of the diaphragm. Additionally, there was a
need to limit subdiaphragm allowable shear loads to control combined orthogonal stresses within the
diaphragm. Recognizing the importance and need to continue the recommendation made by the task
force while taking into consideration the improve performances and standards for diaphragm construction
today, this proposal increases the continuous tie spacing limit to 40 ft in lieu of 25 ft and to use 75% of the
allowable code diaphragm shear to determine the depth of the sub-diaphragm in lieu of the 300 plf and is
deemed appropriate and acceptable. Due to the frequency of this type of failure during the past significant
earthquakes, various jurisdictions within the Los Angeles region have taken this additional step to prevent
roof or floor diaphragms from pulling away from concrete or masonry walls.

FINDINGS:

Local Geological Conditions — Amendment is necessary on the basis of a local geologic condition. The
proposed amendment to require special anchorage of the diaphragm to the wall and limit the allowable
shear will address special needs for concrete and masonry construction with flexible wood diaphragm
The amendment makes modification and changes to better limit personal injury and property damage as
a result of seismic activity and to establish criteria for repair of damaged property following a local
emergency.

Department of Development Services, Building and Safety Bureau and Code Enforcement Division Page 1 of 1
Fire Department, Fire Prevention Bureau Draft Version: 08/05/2016
City Manager, Office of Sustainability

14



THE 2017 PROPOSED AMENDMENTS TO THE LONG BEACH MUNICIPAL CODE

PROPOSED AMENDMENT:
Section 18.40.130 of the Long Beach Municipal Code is amended to read as follows:
18.40.130 — Add CBC Section 4643.401613.7—Suspended ceiling.

Section 1613.7 is added to Chapter 16 of the 2016 Edition of the California Building Code to read as
follows:

1613-101613.7 Suspended Ceilings. Minimum design and installation standards for suspended
ceilings shall be determined in accordance with the requirements of Section 2506.2.1 of this Ccode
and this section.

1643-140-41613.7.1 Scope. This part contains
lighting systems. Provisions of Section 13.5.6 of

ial requirements for suspended ceilings and
CE 7-10 shall apply except as modified herein.

4643-10-21613.7.2 General. The suspend d lighting systems shall be limited to 6 feet
(1828 mm) below the structural deck un bracing is designed by a-icensed-engineeror

1643-40-31613.7.3 Sprinkler Heads.
floor/ceiling or roof/ceiling assemblies,\shalp be designed to allow for free movement of the sprinkler
pipes with oversize rings, sleeves addptors through the ceiling tile. Sprinkler heads and other

g ra ing’fire-resistance-rated floor/ceiling or roof/ceiling assemblies shall comply
of his Ccode.

ANBpecial Requirements for Means of Egress. Suspended ceiling assemblies
pans of egress serving an occupant load of 30 or more shall comply with the following

vertical ngers attached directly to the structural deck along the means of egress serving an
occupant load of 30 or more and at lobbies accessory to Group A Occupancies. Spacing of vertical
hangers shall not exceed 2 feet (610 mm) on center along the entire length of the suspended ceiling
assembly located along the means of egress or at the lobby.

1613-10:4.21613.7.4.2 Assembly Device. All lay-in panels shall be secured to the suspension ceiling
assembly with two hold-down clips minimum for each tile within a 4-foot (1219 mm) radius of the exit
lights and exit signs.

4613:40-4-31613.7.4.3 Emergency Systems. Independent supports and braces shall be provided for
light fixtures required for exit illumination. Power supply for exit illumination shall comply with the
requirements of Section 4686-31008.3 of this Gcode.

1613-10-4-41613.7.4.4 Supports for Appendage. Separate support from the structural deck shall be
provided for all appendages such as light fixtures, air diffusers, exit signs, and similar elements.

RATIONALE:

Administrative changes to reference the latest edition and section of the State’s code. State law requires
that local jurisdictions adopt the 2016 Edition of the California Building Code by January 1, 2017. The

Department of Development Services, Building and Safety Bureau and Code Enforcement Division Page 1 of 2
Fire Department, Fire Prevention Bureau Draft Version: 08/14/2016
City Manager, Office of Sustainability

5



THE 2017 PROPOSED AMENDMENTS TO THE LONG BEACH MUNICIPAL CODE

California Building Code has little to no information regarding the safe design and construction
requirements for ceiling suspension systems subject to seismic loads. It is through the experience of prior
earthquakes, such as the Northridge Earthquake, that this amendment is proposed so as to minimize the
amount of bodily and building damage within the spaces in which this type of ceiling will be installed. This
proposed amendment complements ASCE 7-10 Chapter 13 Section 13.5.6.2.2 and the cited reference to
ASTM E580.

FINDINGS:

Local Geological Conditions — Amendment is necessary on the basis of a local geologic condition. The
proposed amendment requiring safe design and construction requirements for ceiling suspension
systems to resist seismic loads is intended to minimize the amount of damage within a building and along
the path of the means of egress. The amendmen kes modification and changes to better limit
personal injury and property damage as a result of Sefsmic activity and to establish criteria for repair of
damaged property following a local emergency.

Department of Development Services, Building and Safety Bureau and Code Enforcement Division Page 2 of 2
Fire Department, Fire Prevention Bureau Draft Version: 08/14/2016
City Manager, Office of Sustainability

b



THE 2017 PROPOSED AMENDMENTS TO THE LONG BEACH MUNICIPAL CODE

PROPOSED AMENDMENT:
Section 18.40.140 of the Long Beach Municipal Code is amended to read as follows:
18.40.140 - Amend CBC Section 1705.3—Concrete construction.

Section 1705.3 of the 20432016 Edition of the California Building Code is amended to read as
follows:

1705.3 Concrete Construction. The special inspections and verifications—fortests of concrete
construction shall be asregquired-byperformed in accordance with this section and Table 1705.3.

Exceptions: Special inspections and tests shall not be required for:

1. Isolated spread concrete footings of buildir@s three stories or less above grade plane that are
fully supported on earth or rock, whefg the structural design of the footing is based on a
specified compressive strength, fc, ¢ gréaterthan 2,500 pounds per square inch (psi) (17.2
Mpa) regardless of the compressite strength™gpecified in the construction documents or used
in the footing construction.

2. Continuous concrete footl upporting walls of buildings three stories or less in
heightabove grade plane that y supported on earth or rock where:

2.1.The footings supp light-frame construction;

2.3.The 8 p 53ign of the footing is based on a specified compressive strength, f'c, no
: ha 7500 pounds per square inch (psi) (17.2 Mpa), regardiess of the
qipregsive strength specified in the construction documents or used in the footing

¢ ANonsirugtural concrete slabs supported directly on the ground, including prestressed slabs on
gradg, where the effective prestress in the concrete is less than 150 psi (1.03 Mpa).

RATIONALE:

Results from studies after the 1994 Northridge Earthquake indicated that a lot of the damages were
attributed to lack of quality control during construction resulting in poor performance of the building or
structure. This amendment requires special inspection for concrete with a compressive strength greater
than 2,500 pounds per square inch to improve performance through additional quality control measures.

FINDINGS:

Local Geologic Condition — Amendment is necessary on the basis of a local geologic condition. The
proposed modification ensures better performance of building or structure by requiring special inspection
for concrete with a compressive strength greater than 2,500 pounds per square inch. The amendment
makes modification and changes to better limit personal injury and property damage as a result of seismic
activity and to establish criteria for repair of damaged property following a local emergency.

Department of Development Services, Building and Safety Bureau and Code Enforcement Division Page 1of 1
Fire Department, Fire Prevention Bureau Draft Version: 07/15/2016
City Manager, Office of Sustainability



THE 2017 PROPOSED AMENDMENTS TO THE LONG BEACH MUNICIPAL CODE

PROPOSED AMENDMENT:
Section 18.40.150 of the Long Beach Municipal Code is amended to read as follows:
18.40.150 — Amend CBC Section 1705.4112—Seismic resistance.

Exception 3 of Section 17054412 of the 20432016 Edition of the California Building Code is
amended to read as follows:

3. The structure is a detached one- or two-family dwelling not exceeding two stories above grade
plane, is not assigned to Seismic Design Category D, E or F and does not have any of the
following horizontal or vertical irregularities in accordance with Section 12.3 of ASCE 7:

RATIONALE:

2 hillside areas and near the oceanfront. Many
steel moment frame braced frames angfo ;. tilevered columns within these buildings can still be
ith the higher seismic demand placed on buildings in this

area, the language in Sections 1705.1
detached one- or two-family dwellings n
structural elements to be constytre

xceeding two stories above grade plane with complex
the benefit of special inspections. By requiring special

damage as a result of seismic activity and to establish criteria for repair of damaged
property folloWing a local emergency.

Fire Department, Fire Prevention Bureau Draft Version: 07/15/2016

Department of Development Services, Building and Safety Bureau and Code Enforcement Division Page 1 of 1
City Manager, Office of Sustainability



THE 2017 PROPOSED AMENDMENTS TO THE LONG BEACH MUNICIPAL CODE

PROPOSED AMENDMENT:

18.40.160 — Amend CBC Section 1704.51 704.6—Structural observations.

Section 1704:51704.6 of the 20432016 Edition of the California Building Code is amended to read as
follows:

4704-51704.6 Structural observations. Where required by the provisions of Section 1704.5.41704.6.1
or 4704-6:21704.6.2, the owner or the owner's authorized agent shall employ a structural observer to
perform structural observations-as-defined-in-Section 1702, Structural observation does not include or
waive the responsibility for the inspections or special ins ections in Chapter 18.07 of the Long Beach

Municipal Code or special inspections in Section 1705 or other sections of this code. The structural
observer shall be one of the following individuals

.

1. The registered design professional respphgible for the structural design, or

2. A registered design professiona gnatgd by the registered design professional

serygtions, the structural observer shall submit to the Building
{requency and extent of structural observations.

haliCoordinate and call a preconstruction meeting between the
sy, affeoted subcontractors and special inspectors. The structural
observer shall preside over\th Eeting. The purpose of the meeting shall be to identify the major
structural elements and conkections that affect the vertical and lateral load resisting systems of the
structure and to review)schad ing of the required observations. A record of the meeting shall be

i€s shall be reported in writing to the owner or owner’s representative, special
inspector, contractor’gnd the Building Official. Upon the form prescribed by the Building Official, the
hall submit to the Building Official a written statement at each significant
cons tage stating that the site visits have been made and identifying any reported
defiCié which, to the best of the structural observer’s knowledge, have not been resolved. A final
repd He/structural observer which states that all observed deficiencies have been resolved is
glore acceptance of the work by the Building Official.

RATIONALE:

Administrative changes to reference the latest edition of the State’s code. State law requires that local
jurisdictions adopt the 2016 Edition of the California Building Code by January 1, 2017. The language in
Section 1704.6 of the California Building Code permits the owner to employ any registered design
professional to perform structural observations with minimum guideline. However, it is important to
recognize that the registered design professional responsible for the structural design has thorough
knowledge of the building he/she designed. By requiring the registered design professional responsible
for the structural design or their designee who were involved with the design to observe the construction,
the quality of the observation for major structural elements and connections that affect the vertical and
lateral load resisting systems of the structure will greatly be increased. Additional requirements are
provided to help clarify the role and duties of the structural observer and the method of reporting and
correcting observed deficiencies to the building official.

FINDINGS:

Local Geological Condition — Amendment is necessary on the basis of a local geologic condition. The
proposed amendment to require the registered design professional in responsible charge for the

Department of Development Services, Building and Safety Bureau and Code Enforcement Division Page 1 of 2
Fire Department, Fire Prevention Bureau Draft Version: 04/25/2016
City Manager, Office of Sustainability



THE 2017 PROPOSED AMENDMENTS TO THE LONG BEACH MUNICIPAL CODE

structural design to observe the construction will help ensure acceptable standards of workmanship is
provided and to improve the quality of the observation. The amendment makes modification and changes
to better limit personal injury and property damage as a result of seismic activity and to establish criteria
for repair of damaged property following a local emergency.

Department of Development Services, Building and Safety Bureau and Code Enforcement Division Page 2 of 2
Fire Department, Fire Prevention Bureau Draft Version: 04/25/2016 ZO .
City Manager, Office of Sustainability



THE 2017 PROPOSED AMENDMENTS TO THE LONG BEACH MUNICIPAL CODE

PROPOSED AMENDMENT:
Section 18.40.170 of the Long Beach Municipal Code is amended to read as follows:
18.40.170 — Amend CBC Section 1707.1—Alternateive test procedure.
Section 1707.1 of the 20432016 Edition of t‘he California Building Code is amended by changing the

reference to "Section 104.11-Chapter+Division-Hl" to read "Section 18.03.060 of the Long Beach
Municipal Code."

RATIONALE:

This amendment makes minor editorial changes t flect the appropriate reference to the City's
Municipal Code for alternate test procedure.

FINDINGS:

Local Administrative Clarification — A
does not modify a Building Standard p
Health and Safety Code.

t is necessary for local administrative clarification, and
€ to Sections 17958, 17958.5 and 17958.7 of the California

Department of Development Services, Building and Safety Bureau and Code Enforcement Division Page 1 of 1
Fire Department, Fire Prevention Bureau Draft Version: 08/14/2016
City Manager, Office of Sustainability

2



THE 2017 PROPOSED AMENDMENTS TO THE LONG BEACH MUNICIPAL CODE

PROPOSED AMENDMENT:
Section 18.40.180 of the Long Beach Municipal Code is amended to read as follows:
18.40.180 — Amend CBC Section 1807.1.4—Permanent wood foundation systems.

Section 1807.1.4 of the 20432016 Edition of the California Building Code is amended to read as
follows:

1807.1.4 Permanent wood foundation systems. Permanent wood foundation systems shall be
designed and installed in accordance with AF&PA PWF. Lumber and plywood shall be treated in
accordance with AWPA U1 (Commodity Specification A, Use Category 4B and Section 5.2) and shall
be identified in accordance with Section 2303.4.8-42303.1.9.1. Permanent wood foundation systems
shall not be used for structures assigned to Seismje’Design Category D, E or F.

RATIONALE:

pe failures. Most contractors are typically accustomed to
it the Southern California region and are not generally familiar
gatment of wood that makes it suitable for both seismic event and
wet applications. The proposed ehdment takes the precautionary steps to reduce or eliminate potential
problems that may res ing wpod foundation systems that experience relatively rapid decay due to

the fact that the regign d6gs/not experience temperatures cold enough to destroy or retard the growth and
proliferation of wood-destroying6rganisms.

construction in dry and tempera
with the necessary precautions

FINDINGS;

and’ Climatic Conditions — Amendment is necessary on the basis of a local geologic and
climatic conditign/No substantiating data has been provided to show that wood foundation is effective in
i)dings and structures during a seismic event while being subject to deterioration caused by
the combined detrimental effect of constant moisture in the soil and wood-destroying organisms. Wood
foundation systems when they are not properly treated and protected against deterioration have
performed very poorly and have led to slope failures. Most contractors are typically accustomed to
construction in dry and temperate weather in the Southern California region and are not generally familiar
with the necessary precautions and treatment of wood that makes it suitable for both seismic event and
wet applications. The proposed amendment takes the precautionary steps to reduce or eliminate potential
problems that may result in using wood foundation systems that experience relatively rapid decay due to
the fact that the region does not experience temperatures cold enough to destroy or retard the growth and
proliferation of wood-destroying organisms. The amendment makes modification and changes to better
limit personal injury and property damage as a result of seismic or climatic activity and to establish criteria
for repair of damaged property following a local emergency.

Department of Development Services, Building and Safety Bureau and Code Enforcement Division Page 1 of 1
Fire Department, Fire Prevention Bureau Draft Version: 08/14/2016
City Manager, Office of Sustainability

7



THE 2017 PROPOSED AMENDMENTS TO THE LONG BEACH MUNICIPAL CODE

PROPOSED AMENDNMENT:
Section 18.40.190 of the Long Beach Municipal Code is amended to read as follows:

18.40.190 — Amend CBC Section 1807.1.6— Prescriptive design of concrete and masonry foundation
walls.

Section 1807.1.6 of the 20432016 Edition of the California Building Code is amended to read as
follows:

1807.1.6 Prescriptive design of concrete and masonry foundation walls. Concrete and masonry
foundation walls that are laterally supported at the top and bottom shall be permitted to be designed
and constructed in accordance with this section. Prescriptive design of foundation walls shall not be
used for structures assigned to Seismic Design C ory D, EorF.

RATIONALE:

Mgs and structures in this region, it is deemed necessary
to take precautionary steps to reducg/of glindinate potential problems that may result by following
prescriptive design provisions that doe {ake into consideration the surrounding environment. Plain
concrete performs poorly in withstanding the cyclic forces resulting from seismic events. In addition, no
substantiating data has been provided
resisting seismic loads and ma i
and expertise of a registered d ofessional be obtained to properly analyze the structure and take
these issues into consideration.

FINDINGS:

Local Geologic Cond Amendment is necessary on the basis of a local geologic condition. With the
higher seispriic demand\glaced on buildings and structures in this region, it is deemed necessary to take
precautigna aps/to reduce or eliminate potential problems that may result by following prescriptive
at does not take into consideration the surrounding environment. Plain concrete
in withstanding the cyclic forces resulting from seismic events. In addition, no
substantiating data has been provided to show that under-reinforced foundation walls are effective in
resisting seismic loads and may potentially lead to a higher risk of failure. It is important that the benefit
and expertise of a registered design professional be obtained to properly analyze the structure and take
these issues into consideration. The amendment makes modification and changes to better limit personal
injury and property damage as a result of seismic activity and to establish criteria for repair of damaged
property following a local emergency.

performs_ poQ

Department of Development Services, Building and Safety Bureau and Code Enforcement Division Page 1 of 1
Fire Department, Fire Prevention Bureau Draft Version: 08/14/2016
City Manager, Office of Sustainability



THE 2017 PROPOSED AMENDMENTS TO THE LONG BEACH MUNICIPAL CODE

PROPOSED AMENDMENT:
Section 18.40.200 of the Long Beach Municipal Code is amended to read as follows:
18.40.200 -~ Amend CBC Section 1809.3—Stepped footings.

Section 1809.3 of the 20432016 Edition of the California Building Code is amended to read as
follows:

1809.3 Stepped footings. The top surface of footings shall be level. The bottom surface of footings
shall be permitted to have a slope not exceeding one unit vertical in 10 units horizontal (10-percent
slope). Footings shall be stepped where it is necessary to change the elevation of the top surface of
the footing or where the surface of the ground slopes more than one unit vertical in 10 units horizontal
(10-percent slope).

For structures assigned to Seismic Design G4l
apply to the top surface of grade beams sufporting
inch diameter (12.7 mm) deformed reinf g bars. 1
the footings as shown in Figure 1809.3// >

D, E or F, the stepping requirement shall also
3jls. Footings shall be reinforced with four 1/2-
#o bars shall be place at the top and bottom of

RECOMMEND: & > b
bg 29

== MIN, 2-#4 REBAR (TOP & i
P {TOP & BOTTOM)
==t=2 ~BOTTOM PLATE (TYP:}

o !
: — GRADE

STEPPED FOUNDATIONS

FIGURE 1809.3
STEPPED FOOTING

RATIONALE:

With the higher seismic demand placed on buildings and structures in this region, precautionary steps are
proposed to reduce or eliminate potential problems that may result for under reinforced footings located
on sloped surfaces. Requiring minimum reinforcement for stepped footings is intended to address the
problem of poor performance of plain or under-reinforced footings during a seismic event. This proposed
amendment is a continuation of an amendment adopted during previous code adoption cycles.

FINDINGS:

Local Geologic Condition — Amendment is necessary on the basis of a local geologic condition. With the
higher seismic demand placed on buildings and structures in this region, precautionary steps are
proposed to reduce or eliminate potential problems that may result for under reinforced footings located
on sloped surfaces. Requiring minimum reinforcement for stepped footings is intended to address the

Department of Development Services, Building and Safety Bureau and Code Enforcement Division Page 1 of 2
Fire Department, Fire Prevention Bureau Draft Version: 08/14/2016
City Manager, Office of Sustainability



THE 2017 PROPOSED AMENDMENTS TO THE LONG BEACH MUNICIPAL CODE

problem of poor performance of plain or under-reinforced footings during a seismic event. The
amendment makes modification and changes to better limit personal injury and property damage as a
result of seismic activity and to establish criteria for repair of damaged property following a local
emergency.

Department of Development Services, Building and Safety Bureau and Code Enforcement Division Page 2 of 2
Fire Department, Fire Prevention Bureau Draft Version: 08/14/2016 2
City Manager, Office of Sustainability



THE 2017 PROPOSED AMENDMENTS TO THE LONG BEACH MUNICIPAL CODE

PROPOSED AMENDMENT:
Section 18.40.210 of the Long Beach Municipal Code is amended to read as follows:

18.40.210 — Amend CBC Section 1809.7 and Table 1809.7— Prescriptive footings for light-frame
construction.

Section 1809.7 and Table 1809.7 of the 20432016 Edition of the California Building Code are
amended to read as follows:

1809.7 Prescriptive footings for light-frame construction. Where a specific design is not provided,
concrete or masonry-unit footings supporting walls of light-frame construction shall be permitted to be
designed in accordance with Table 1809.7. Prescriptive footings in Table 1809.7 shall not exceed one
story above grade plane for structures assigned to 8gismic Design Category D, E or F.

PRESCRIPTIVE FOOT{N PORTING WALLS OF

LIGHT-FRAMEBCONSTRULZTION & b.c.d,e
NUMBER OF FLOORS
SUPPORTED BY THE IPTH OF FOOTING THICKNESS OF
FOOTING f (inches) FOOTING (inches)
1 NN 12 6
2 / 15 6
3/ —~ 18 8
For Sl 1 inch = 25.4 mm, 1\foot/= 304.8 mm
a.  Depth of footings shall be in accorgance with Section 1809.4.
The ground under the'Tlogr shal be)permitted to be excavated to the elevation of the top of the footing.

b.
c. Not Adopted.
d. See Section 1908

e.

Ruitted to support a roof addition to the stipulated number of floors. Footings supporting roof only shall
upporting one floor.

RATIO

No substantiating data has been provided to show that under-reinforced footings are effective in resisting
seismic loads and may potentially lead to a higher risk of failure. Therefore, this proposed amendment
requires minimum reinforcement in continuous footings to address the problem of poor performance of
plain or under-reinforced footings during a seismic event. With the higher seismic demand placed on
buildings and structures in this region, precautionary steps are proposed to reduce or eliminate potential
problems that may result by following prescriptive design provisions for footing that does not take into
consideration the surrounding environment. It was important that the benefit and expertise of a registered
design professional be obtained to properly analyze the structure and take these issues into
consideration. This amendment reflects the recommendations by the Structural Engineers Association of
Southern California (SEAOSC) and the Los Angeles City Task Force that investigated the poor
performance observed in the 1994 Northridge Earthquake. This proposed amendment is a continuation of
an amendment adopted during previous code adoption cycles.

FINDINGS:

Local Geologic Condition — Amendment is necessary on the basis of a local geologic condition. No
substantiating data has been provided to show that under-reinforced footings are effective in resisting
seismic loads and may potentially lead to a higher risk of failure. Therefore, the amendment requires
minimum reinforcement in continuous footings to address the problem of poor performance of plain or
under-reinforced footings during a seismic event. With the higher seismic demand placed on buildings

Department of Development Services, Building and Safety Bureau and Code Enforcement Division Page 1 of 2
Fire Department, Fire Prevention Bureau Draft Version: 08/14/2016
City Manager, Office of Sustainability



THE 2017 PROPOSED AMENDMENTS TO THE LONG BEACH MUNICIPAL CODE

and structures in this region, precautionary steps are proposed to reduce or eliminate potential problems
that may result by following prescriptive design provisions for footing that does not take into consideration
the surrounding environment. It was important that the benefit and expertise of a registered design
professional be obtained to properly analyze the structure and take these issues into consideration. This
amendment reflects the recommendations by the Structural Engineers Association of Southern California
(SEAOSC) and the Los Angeles City Task Force that investigated the poor performance observed in
1994 Northridge Earthquake. The amendment makes modification and changes to better limit personal
injury and property damage as a result of seismic activity and to establish criteria for repair of damaged
property following a local emergency.

Department of Development Services, Building and Safety Bureau and Code Enforcement Division ) Page 2 of 2
Fire Department, Fire Prevention Bureau Draft Version: 08/14/2016 :
City Manager, Office of Sustainability 2.



THE 2017 PROPOSED AMENDMENTS TO THE LLONG BEACH MUNICIPAL CODE

PROPOSED AMENDMENT:
Section 18.40.220 of the Long Beach Municipal Code is amended to read as follows:
18.40.220 — Amend CBC Section 1809.12—Timber footings.

Section 1809.12 of the 20432016 Edition of the California Building Code is amended to read as
follows:

1809.12 Timber footings. Timber footings shall be permitted for buildings of Type V construction and
as otherwise approved by the Building Official. Such footings shall be treated in accordance with
AWPA U1 (Commodity Specification A, Use Category 4B). Treated timbers are not required where
placed entirely below permanent water level, or where used as capping for wood piles that project
above the water level over submerged or marsh Jépds. The compressive stresses perpendicular to
grain in untreated timber footing supported upghtreated piles shall not exceed 70 percent of the
allowable stresses for the species and gradeo her as specified in the AF&PAANSI/AWC NDS.
Timber footings shall not be used in structurés d,to Seismic Design Category D, E or F.

%!

RATIONALE:

No substantiating data has been provr show that timber footings are effective in supporting
buildings and structures during g everit, especially while being subjected to deterioration caused

Southern California regjoh and are npot generally familiar with the necessary precautions and treatment of

wood that makes it sui Gth seismic event and wet applications. The proposed amendment takes
the precautionary duee or eliminate potential problems that may result by using timber footings
that experience relatively rapid decay due to the face that the region does not experience temperatures
cold enough to de royNor retard the growth and proliferation of wood- destroyrng orgamsms This

Local Geologic and Climatic Conditions — Amendment is necessary on the basis of a local geologic and
climatic condition. No substantiating data has been provided to show that timber footings is effective in
supporting buildings and structures during a seismic event while being subject to deterioration caused by
the combined detrimental effect of constant moisture in the soil and wood-destroying organisms. Timber
footings, when they are not properly treated and protected against deterioration, have performed very
poorly. Most contractors are typically accustomed to construction in dry and temperate weather in the
Southern California region and are not generally familiar with the necessary precautions and treatment of
wood that makes it suitable for both seismic event and wet applications. The proposed amendment takes
the precautionary steps to reduce or eliminate potential problems that may result by using timber footings
that experience relatively rapid decay due to the fact that the region does not experience temperatures
cold enough to destroy or retard the growth and proliferation of wood-destroying organisms. The
amendment makes modification and changes to better limit personal injury and property damage as a
result of seismic or climatic activity and to establish criteria for repair of damaged property following a
local emergency.

Department of Development Services, Building and Safety Bureau and Code Enforcement Division Page 1 of 1
Fire Department, Fire Prevention Bureau Draft Version: 08/14/2016
City Manager, Office of Sustainability



THE 2017 PROPOSED AMENDMENTS TO THE LONG BEACH MUNICIPAL CODE

PROPOSED AMENDMENT:
Section 18.40.230 of the Long Beach Municipal Code is amended to read as follows:
18.40.230 — Amend CBC Section 1810.3.2.4—Timber.

Section 1810.3.2.4 of the 20432016 Edition of the California Building Code is amended to read as
follows:

1810.3.2.4 Timber. Timber deep foundation elements shall be designed as piles or poles in
accordance with AE&RAANSI/AWC NDS. Round timber elements shall conform to ASTM D 25. Sawn
timber elements shall conform to DOC PS-20. Timber shall not be used in structures assigned to
Seismic Design Category D, E or F.

RATIONALE:

No substantiating data has been provided tg

how that tirhber deep foundation is effective in supporting
et while being subject to deterioration caused by the
& in the soil and wood-destroying organisms. Timber deep
foundation, when they are not properly
poorly. Most contractors are typically acct
Southern California region and agen

the precautionary steps to reduce\pf gliminate potential problems that may result by using timber deep
foundation that experience relatively rapid decay due to the face that the region does not experience

This proposed amernk Adntinuation of an amendment adopted during previous code adoption
cycles.

FINDINGS;

Local @ed gng Climatic Conditions — Amendment is necessary on the basis of a local geologic and

climaticyqonditjgn
i)dings and structures during a seismic event while being subject to deterioration caused by
the combined detrimental effect of constant moisture in the soil and wood-destroying organisms. Timber
footings, when they are not properly treated and protected against deterioration, have performed very
poorly. Most contractors are typically accustomed to construction in dry and temperate weather in the
Southern California region and are not generally familiar with the necessary precautions and treatment of
wood that makes it suitable for both seismic event and wet applications. The proposed amendment takes
the precautionary steps to reduce or eliminate potential problems that may result by using timber footings
that experience relatively rapid decay due to the fact that the region does not experience temperatures
cold enough to destroy or retard the growth and proliferation of wood-destroying organisms. The
amendment makes modification and changes to better limit personal injury and property damage as a
result of seismic or climatic activity and to establish criteria for repair of damaged property following a
local emergency.

Department of Development Services, Building and Safety Bureau and Code Enforcement Division Page 1 of 1
Fire Department, Fire Prevention Bureau Draft Version: 08/14/2016
City Manager, Office of Sustainability

9



THE 2017 PROPOSED AMENDMENTS TO THE LONG BEACH MUNICIPAL CODE

PROPOSED AMENDMENT:
Section 18.40.240 of the Long Beach Municipal Code is amended to read as follows:
18.40.240 — Amend CBC Section 2304-14-72304.12.5—Wood used in retaining walls and cribs.

Section 2304-44-72304.12.5 of the 26432016 Edition of the California Building Code is amended to
read as follows:

2304-14-72304.12.5 Wood used in retaining walls and cribs. Wood installed in retaining or crib walls
shall be preservative treated in accordance with AWPA U1 {Cemmodity-Specifications-A-orF)-for soil

and fresh water use. Wood shall not be used in retaining or crib walls for structures assigned to Seismic
Design Category D, E or F.

RATIONALE:

No substantiating data has been provided to ghow that wodd used in retaining or crib walls are effective in

performed very poorly. Most contractors 2 pically accustomed to construction in dry and temperate
weather in the Southern Californig ! 3
treatment of wood that make
amendment takes the precautid
using wood in retaining or crib

sfeps to reduce or eliminate potential problems that may result by
hat experience relatively rapid decay due to the face that the region

,-‘@@: dition — Amendment is necessary on the basis of a local geologic and climatic condition.
v . .

supporting™\quildings and structures during a seismic event while being subject to deterioration caused by
the combined detrimental effect of constant moisture in the soil and wood-destroying organisms. Wood
used in retaining or crib walls, when they are not properly treated and protected against deterioration, have
performed very poorly. Most contractors are typically accustomed to construction in dry and temperate
weather in the Southern California region and are not generally familiar with the necessary precautions and
treatment of wood that makes it suitable for both seismic event and wet applications. The proposed
amendment takes the precautionary steps to reduce or eliminate potential problems that may result by
using wood in retalnlng or crib walls that experience relatively rapid decay due to the fact that the region
does not experience temperatures cold enough to destroy or retard the growth and proliferation of wood-
destroying organisms. The amendment makes modification and changes to better limit personal injury and
property damage as a result of seismic or climatic activity and to establish criteria for repair of damaged
property following a local emergency.

Fire Department, Fire Prevention Bureau Draft Version: 08/14/2016

Department of Development Services, Building and Safety Bureau and Code Enforcement Division Page 1 of 1 .
City Manager, Office of Sustainability 9



THE 2017 PROPOSED AMENDMENTS TO THE LONG BEACH MUNICIPAL CODE

PROPOSED AMENDMENT:
Section 18.40.250 of the Long Beach Municipal Code is amended to read as follows:
18.40.250 — Add CBC Section 2305.4—Quality of nails.

Section 2305.4 is added to Chapter 23 of the 20432016 Edition of the California Building Code to read
as follows:

2305.4 Quality of Nails. In Seismic Design Category D, E or F, mechanically driven nails used in wood
structural panel shear walls shall meet the same dimensions as that required for hand-driven nails,
including diameter, minimum length and minimum head diameter. Clipped head or box nails are not
permitted in new construction. The allowable design value for clipped head nails in existing construction
may be taken at no more than the nail-head-area rzfj® of that of the same size hand-driven nails.

RATIONALE:

The overdriving of nails into the structural anel still remains a concern when pneumatic nail guns
ail Mailing. Box nails were observed to cause massive and
wood during the 1994 Northridge Earthquake. The use of

nails from pulling through sheathing materials. Clipped or
mechanically driven nails used inw tructural panel shear wall construction were found to perform much
less in previous wood structural\payfel shear wall testing done at the University of California Irvine. The
existing test results indjcatey tha
energy absorbent a ductile” The panels reached ultimate load capacity and failed at substantially
less lateral deflect
recommendation
Angeles City Joint SaskR\Force that investigated the poor performance observed in 1994 Northridge
is proposéd amendment is a continuation of an amendment adopted during previous code

Local Geologic Condition — Amendment is necessary on the basis of a local geologic condition. The
overdriving of nails into the structural wood panel still remains a concern when pneumatic nail guns are
used for wood structural panel shear wall nailing. Box nails were observed to cause massive and multiple
failures of the typical 3/8-inch thick plywood during the 1994 Northridge Earthquake. The use of clipped
head nails continues to be restricted from being used in wood structural panel shear walls where the
minimum nail head size must be maintained in order to minimize nails from pulling through sheathing
materials. Clipped or mechanically driven nails used in wood structural panel shear wall construction were
found to perform much less in previous wood structural panel shear wall testing done at the University of
California Irvine. The existing test results indicated that, under cyclic loading, the wood structural panel
shear walls were less energy absorbent and less ductile. The panels reached ultimate load capacity and
failed at substantially less lateral deflection than those using same size hand-driven nails. This amendment
reflects the recommendations by the Structural Engineers Association of Southern California (SEAOSC)
and the Los Angeles City Joint Task Force that investigated the poor performance observed in 1994
Northridge Earthquake. The amendment makes modification and changes to better limit personal injury and
property damage as a result of seismic activity and to establish criteria for repair of damaged property
following a local emergency.

Department of Development Services, Building and Safety Bureau and Code Enforcement Division Page 1 of 1
Fire Department, Fire Prevention Bureau Draft Version: 08/14/2016
City Manager, Office of Sustainability

3l



THE 2017 PROPOSED AMENDMENTS TO THE LONG BEACH MUNICIPAL CODE

PROPOSED AMENDMENT:
Section 18.40.260 of the Long Beach Municipal Code is amended to read as follows:
18.40.260 — Add CBC Section 2305.5—Hold-down connectors.

Section 2305.5 is added to Chapter 23 of the 20432016 Edition of the California Building Code to read
as follows:

2305.5 Hold-down connectors. In Seismic Design Category D, E or F, hold-down connectors shall be
designed to resist shear wall overturning moments using approved cyclic load values or 75 percent of
the allowable seismic load values that do not consider cyclic loading of the product. Connector bolts
into wood framing shall require steel plate washers on the post on the opposite side of the anchorage
device. Plate size shall be a minimum of 0.229 inc 3 inches by 3 inches (5.82 mm by 76 mm by 76
mm) in size. Hold-down connectors shall be tigh d to finger tight plus one half (1/2) wrench turn just
prior to covering the wall framing.

RATIONALE:

ICC-ES AC 155 Acceptance Criteria fo
used to establish allowable values for hold~d
loading to establish allowable vajue

cdowns (Tie-Downs) Attached to Wood Members is widely

pntinues to limit the allowable capacity to 75% of the evaluation report
value to provide an gd for of safety for statically tested anchorage devices. Steel plate washers
will reduce the add ué@ that can result when hold-down connectors are fastened to wood framing
members. This @endgient reflects the recommendations by the Structural Engineers Association of
Southern CaliforniaXSEAQDSC) and the Los Angeles City Joint Task Force that investigated the poor
performance observed ¥1994 Northridge Earthquake. This proposed amendment is a continuation of an

Local Geologic Condition — Amendment is necessary on the basis of a local geologic condition. ICC-ES AC
165 Acceptance Criteria for Hold-downs (Tie-Downs) Attached to Wood Members is widely used to
establish allowable values for hold-down connectors in evaluation reports. AC 155 uses monotonic loading
to establish allowable values. Yet, cyclic and dynamic forces imparted on buildings and structures by
seismic activity cause more damage than equivalent forces that are applied in a monotonic manner.
However, the engineering, regulatory and manufacturing industries have not reached consensus on the
appropriate cyclic or dynamic testing protocols. This condition is expected to continue for some time. This
amendment continues to limit the allowable capacity to 75% of the acceptance report value to provide an
additional factor of safety for statically tested anchorage devices. Steel plate washers will reduce the
additional damage that can result when hold-down connectors are fastened to wood framing members.
This amendment reflects the recommendations by the Structural Engineers Association of Southern
California (SEAOSC) and the Los Angeles City Joint Task Force that investigated the poor performance
observed in 1994 Northridge Earthquake. The amendment makes modification and changes to better limit
personal injury and property damage as a result of seismic activity and to establish criteria for repair of
damaged property following a local emergency.

Department of Development Services, Building and Safety Bureau and Code Enforcement Division Page 1 of 1
Fire Department, Fire Prevention Bureau Draft Version: 08/14/2016
City Manager, Office of Sustainability

1A



THE 2017 PROPOSED AMENDMENTS TO THE LONG BEACH MUNICIPAL CODE

PROPOSED AMENDMENT:

Section 18.40.270 of the Long Beach Municipal Code is amended to read as follows:

18.40.270 — Amend CBC Section 2306.2—Wood-frame diaphragms.
Section 2306.2 of the 26432016 Edition of the California Building Code is amended to read as follows:
2306.2 Wood-frame diaphragms. Wood-frame diaphragms shall be designed and constructed in
accordance with AE&PAAWC SDPWS. Where panels are fastened to framing members with staples,
requirements and limitations of AF&RAAWC SDPWS shall be met and the allowable shear values set

forth in Table 2306.2(1) or 2306.2(2) shall only be permitted for structures assigned to Seismic Design
Category A, B, or C.

(SEAOSC) and the Los Angeles City Joint
investigated the damages to buildings and structures during the 1994 Northridge
Earthquak®, recommended reducing allowable shear values in wood structural panel shear walls or
diaphragms that were not substantiated by cyclic testing. That recommendation was consistent with a report
to the Governor from the Seismic Safety Commission of the State of California recommending that code
requirements be "more thoroughly substantiated with testing.” The allowable shear values for wood
structural panel shear walls or diaphragms fastened with staples are based on monotonic testing and does
not take into consideration that earthquake forces load shear wall or diaphragm in a repeating and fully
reversible manner.

In September 2007, limited cyclic testing was conducted by a private engineering firm to determine if wood
structural panels fastened with staples would exhibit the same behavior as the wood structural panels
fastened with common nails. The test result revealed that wood structural panel fastened with staples
appeared to be much lower in strength and stiffness than wood structural panels fastened with common
nails. It was recommended that the use of staples as fasteners for wood structural panel shear walls or
diaphragms not be permitted to resist seismic forces in structures assigned to Seismic Design Category D,
E and F unless it can be substantiated by cyclic testing.

Furthermore, the cities and county within the Los Angeles region has taken extra measures to maintain the
structural integrity of the framing of shear walls and diaphragms designed for high levels of seismic forces
by requiring wood sheathing be applied directly over the framing members and prohibiting the use of panels
placed over gypsum sheathing. This proposed amendment is intended to prevent the undesirable

Department of Development Services, Building and Safety Bureau and Code Enforcement Division Page 1 of 2
Fire Department, Fire Prevention Bureau Draft Version: 08/14/2016
City Manager, Office of Sustainability

%%



THE 2017 PROPOSED AMENDMENTS TO THE LONG BEACH MUNICIPAL CODE

performance of nails when gypsum board softens due to cyclic earthquake displacements and the nail
ultimately does not have any engagement in a solid material within the thickness of the gypsum board.

This proposed amendment continues the previous amendment adopted during the 2010 code adoption
cycle.

FINDINGS:

Local Geologic Condition — Amendment is necessary on the basis of a local geologic condition. The
Structural Engineers Association of Southern California (SEAOSC) and the Los Angeles City Joint Task
Force that investigated the damages to buildings and structures during the 1994 Northridge Earthquake
recommended reducing allowable shear values in wood structural panel shear walls or diaphragms that
were not substantiated by cyclic testing. That recommendation was consistent with a report to the Governor

gar wall ordiaphragm in a repeating and fully reversible
was conducted by a private engineering firm to determine
ould exhibit the same behavior as the wood structural

consideration that earthquake forces load
manner. In September 2007, limited cyclic i
if wood structural panels fastened with sta
panels fastened with common nails.
staples appeared to be much lower in stre
common nails. it was recommengde
walls or diaphragms not be pefmi to resist seismic forces in structures assigned to Seismic Design
Category D, E and F unless it dan ubstantiated by cyclic testing. Furthermore, the cities and county
taken extra measures to maintain the structural integrity of the framing
of shear walls and diaphfagins désigned for high levels of seismic forces by requiring wood sheathing be
applied directly over theArarfing npembers and prohibiting the use of panels placed over gypsum sheathing.
This amendment i |d o grevent the undesirable performance of nails when gypsum board softens
due to cyclic earthquake displacements and the nail ultimately does not have any engagement in a solid
material within the thickngss of the gypsum board. The amendment makes modification and changes to
better limit p€rsonal injwy and property damage as a result of seismic activity and to establish criteria for
repair of dar d property following a local emergency.

%

Department of Development Services, Building and Safety Bureau and Code Enforcement Division Page 2 of 2
Fire Department, Fire Prevention Bureau Draft Version: 08/14/2016
City Manager, Office of Sustainability



THE 2017 PROPOSED AMENDMENTS TO THE LONG BEACH MUNICIPAL CODE

PROPOSED AMENDMENT:

Section 18.40.280 of the Long Beach Municipal Code is amended to read as follows:

18.40.280 — Amend CBC Section 2306.3—Wood-frame shear walls.
Section 2306.3 of the 20432016 Edition of the California Building Code is amended to read as follows:
2306.3 Wood-frame shear walls. Wood-frame shear walls shall be designed and constructed in

accordance with AF&PAAWC SDPWS. For structures assigned to Seismic Design Category D, E, or
F, application of Tables 4.3A and 4.3B of AF&PAAWC SDPWS shall include the following:

1. Wood structural panel thickness for shear walls shall not be less than 3/8 inch thick and studs
shall not be spaced at more than 16 inchesg’oh center.

2. The maximum nominal unit shear cafa
seismic forces in structures assignedt6 Sg
linear foot (plf).

for 3/8 inch wood structural panels resisting
5 Design Category D, E or F is 400 pounds per

Exception: Other nominal Anft £h€ar capacites may be permitted if such values are
substantiated by cyclic testing and(approved by the building official.

om the edge of the connecting members for shear greater than 350 plf using ASD or 500 plf
9\LRFD. Nails shall be placed not less than 3/8 inch from panel edges and not less than
chi from the edge of the connecting members for shears of 350 plf or less using ASD or

00 p

ff or less using LRFD.

&

able 4.3B application is not allowed for structures assigned to Seismic Design Category D, E,
orF.

For structures assigned to Seismic Design Category D, application of Table 4.3C of AE&RAAWC
SDPWS shall not be used below the top level in a multi-level building for structures.

Where panels are fastened to framing members with staples, requirements and limitations of
AFE&PAAWC SDPWS shall be met and the allowable shear values set forth in Table 2306.3(1),
2306.3(2) or 2306.3(3) shall only be permitted for structures assigned to Seismic Design Category A,
B, or C.

Exception: Allowable shear values where panels are fastened to framing members with staples
may be used if such values are substantiated by cyclic testing and approved by the building official.

The allowable shear values in Tables 2306.3(1) and 2306.3(2) are permitted to be increased 40 percent
for wind design. Panels complying with ANSI/APA PRP-210 shall be permitted to use design values for
Plywood Siding in the AE&RAAWC SDPWS.

Department of Development Services, Building and Safety Bureau and Code Enforcement Division Page 1 of 3
Fire Department, Fire Prevention Bureau Draft Version: 08/14/2016
City Manager, Office of Sustainability



THE 2017 PROPOSED AMENDMENTS TO THE LONG BEACH MUNICIPAL CODE

RATIONALE:

The Structural Engineers Association of Southern California (SEAOSC) and the Los Angeles City Joint
Task Force that investigated the damages to buildings and structures during the 1994 Northridge
Earthquake recommended reducing allowable shear values in wood structural panel shear walls or
diaphragms that were not substantiated by cyclic testing. That recommendation was consistent with a report
to the Governor from the Seismic Safety Commission of the State of California recommending that code
requirements be "more thoroughly substantiated with testing.” The allowable shear values for wood
structural panel shear walls or diaphragms fastened with stapled nails are based on monotonic testing and
does not take into consideration that earthquake forces load shear wall or diaphragm in a repeating and
fully reversible manner.

a private engineering firm to determine if wood
it the same behavior as the wood structural panels
ood structural panel fastened with stapled nails

& wood structural panels fastened with common
nails. It was recommended that the use of s{abted nail adAasteners for wood structural panel shear walls
ispiicAsrces in structures assigned to Seismic Design Category

Furthermore, the cities and county within ths
structural integrity of the framing of-she S
ly over the framing members and prohibiting the use of panels
i8” proposed amendment is intended to prevent the undesirable
board softens due to cyclic earthquake displacements and the nail

ultimately does not havg aggment in a solid material within the thickness of the gypsum board.
This proposed a ontinues the previous amendment adopted during the 2010 code adoption
cycle.

Local Geol Condition — Amendment is necessary on the basis of a local geologic condition. The
ineers Association of Southern California (SEAOSC) and the Los Angeles City Joint Task
Force that inVestigated the damages to buildings and structures during the 1994 Northridge Earthquake
recommended reducing allowable shear values in wood structural panel shear walls or diaphragms that
were not substantiated by cyclic testing. That recommendation was consistent with a report to the Governor
from the Seismic Safety Commission of the State of California recommending that code requirements be
“more thoroughly substantiated with testing.” The allowable shear values for wood structural panel shear
walls or diaphragms fastened with stapled nails are based on monotonic testing and does not take into
consideration that earthquake forces load shear wall or diaphragm in a repeating and fully reversible
manner. In September 2007, limited cyclic testing was conducted by a private engineering firm to determine
if wood structural panels fastened with stapled nails would exhibit the same behavior as the wood structural
panels fastened with common nails. The test result revealed that wood structural panel fastened with
stapled nails appeared to be much lower in strength and stiffness than wood structural panels fastened with
common nails. It was recommended that the use of stapled nail as fasteners for wood structural panel shear
walls or diaphragms not be permitted to resist seismic forces in structures assigned to Seismic Design
Category D, E and F unless it can be substantiated by cyclic testing. Furthermore, the cities and county
within the Los Angeles region has taken extra measures to maintain the structural integrity of the framing
of shear walls and diaphragms designed for high levels of seismic forces by requiring wood sheathing be
applied directly over the framing members and prohibiting the use of panels placed over gypsum sheathing.
This amendment is intended to prevent the undesirable performance of nails when gypsum board softens
due to cyclic earthquake displacements and the nail ultimately does not have any engagement in a solid
material within the thickness of the gypsum board. The amendment makes modification and changes to

Department of Development Services, Building and Safety Bureau and Code Enforcement Division Page 20f 3
Fire Department, Fire Prevention Bureau Draft Version: 08/14/2016
City Manager, Office of Sustainability



THE 2017 PROPOSED AMENDMENTS TO THE LONG BEACH MUNICIPAL CODE

better limit personal injury and property damage as a result of seismic activity and to establish criteria for
repair of damaged property following a local emergency.

Fire Department, Fire Prevention Bureau Draft Version: 08/14/2016

Department of Development Services, Building and Safety Bureau and Code Enforcement Division Page 3 of 3 3
City Manager, Office of Sustainability



THE 2017 PROPOSED AMENDMENTS TO THE LONG BEACH MUNICIPAL CODE

PROPOSED AMENDMENT:
Section 18.40.290 of the Long Beach Municipal Code is amended to read as follows:
18.40.290 — Add CBC Section 2307.2—Wood-frame shear walls.
Section 2307.2 is added to the 26432016 Edition of the California Building Code to read as follows:

2307.2 Wood-frame shear walls. Wood-frame shear walls shall be designed and constructed in
accordance with Section 2306.3 as applicable.

RATIONALE:

The Structural Engineers Association of Southern @
Task Force that investigated the damages to 8

ornia (SEAOSC) and the Los Angeles City Joint
gs and structures during the 1994 Northridge

diaphragms that were not substantiated by cyefig ing. Twat recommendation was consistent with a report
to the Governor from the Seismic Safety fysion of the State of California recommending that code
requirements be "more thoroughly sub

ppled nails would exhibit the same behavior as the wood structural panels
fastened with common pdils\The Yest result revealed that wood structural panel fastened with stapled nails
in stgEngth and stiffness than wood structural panels fastened with common
he use of stapled nail as fasteners for wood structural panel shear walls
or diaphragms notbe Pefmitted to resist seismic forces in structures assigned to Seismic Design Category
D, E and F unless itsan be substantiated by cyclic testing.

z s and county within the Los Angeles region has taken extra measures to maintain the

{ng Woddsheathing be applied directly over the framing members and prohibiting the use of panels
placed ove( gfpsum sheathing. This proposed amendment is intended to prevent the undesirable
performance “of nails when gypsum board softens due to cyclic earthquake displacements and the nail
ultimately does not have any engagement in a solid material within the thickness of the gypsum board.

This proposed amendment continues the previous amendment adopted during the 2010 code adoption
cycle.

FINDINGS:

Local Geologic Condition — Amendment is necessary on the basis of a local geologic condition. The
Structural Engineers Association of Southern California (SEAOSC) and the Los Angeles City Joint Task
Force that investigated the damages to buildings and structures during the 1994 Northridge Earthquake
recommended reducing allowable shear values in wood structural panel shear walls or diaphragms that
were not substantiated by cyclic testing. That recommendation was consistent with a report to the Governor
from the Seismic Safety Commission of the State of California recommending that code requirements be
“more thoroughly substantiated with testing.” The allowable shear values for wood structural panel shear
walls or diaphragms fastened with stapled nails are based on monotonic testing and does not take into
consideration that earthquake forces load shear wall or diaphragm in a repeating and fully reversible
manner. In September 2007, limited cyclic testing was conducted by a private engineering firm to determine
if wood structural panels fastened with stapled nails would exhibit the same behavior as the wood structural
panels fastened with common nails. The test result revealed that wood structural panel fastened with

Department of Development Services, Building and Safety Bureau and Code Enforcement Division Page 1 of 2
Fire Department, Fire Prevention Bureau Draft Version: 08/14/2016
City Manager, Office of Sustainability

El-



THE 2017 PROPOSED AMENDMENTS TO THE LONG BEACH MUNICIPAL CODE

stapled nails appeared to be much lower in strength and stiffness than wood structural panels fastened with
common nails. It was recommended that the use of stapled nail as fasteners for wood structural panel shear
walls or diaphragms not be permitted to resist seismic forces in structures assigned to Seismic Design
Category D, E and F unless it can be substantiated by cyclic testing. Furthermore, the cities and county
within the Los Angeles region has taken extra measures to maintain the structural integrity of the framing
of shear walls and diaphragms designed for high levels of seismic forces by requiring wood sheathing be
applied directly over the framing members and prohibiting the use of panels placed over gypsum sheathing.
This amendment is intended to prevent the undesirable performance of nails when gypsum board softens
due to cyclic earthquake displacements and the nail ultimately does not have any engagement in a solid
material within the thickness of the gypsum board. The amendment makes modification and changes to
better limit personal injury and property damage as a result of seismic activity and to establish criteria for
repair of damaged property following a local emergency.

Department of Development Services, Building and Safety Bureau and Code Enforcement Division Page 2 of 2
Fire Department, Fire Prevention Bureau Draft Version: 08/14/2016
City Manager, Office of Sustainability

r



THE 2017 PROPOSED AMENDMENTS TO THE LONG BEACH MUNICIPAL CODE

PROPOSED AMENDMENT:
Section 18.40.300 of the Long Beach Municipal Code is amended to read as follows:
18.40.300 — Amend CBC Section 2308-3-42308.6.8.1—Braced wall line support.

Section 2308-3-42308.6.8.1 of the 26432016 Edition of the California Building Code is amended to read
as follows:

2308-3-4-Braced-wall-line—support2308.6.8.1 Foundation requirements. Braced wall lines shall be

supporied by continuous foundations.

Exception: For structures with a maximum plan dimension not over 50 feet (15240 mm), continuous
foundations are required at exterior walls only tructures assigned to Seismic Design Category
A, BorC.

For structures in Seismic Design Categorie anchE, exterior braced wall panels shall be in the same
plane vertically with the foundation or the gOrtion of thetructure containing the offset shall be designed
in accordance with accepted engineeringfrastice and Section 2308.1.1.

RATIONALE:

Buildings and structures in this region, interior walls can easily
be called upon to resist over half of\tHie’seismic loading imposed on simple buildings or structures. Without
a continuous foundation to suppqrt the braced wall line, seismic loads would be transferred through other
elements such as non-gtrictyral doncrete slab floors, wood floors, etc. The proposed change is to limit the

use of the exception eg’assigned to Seismic Design Category A, B or C where lower seismic
demands are expeg AQ interior braced walls be supported by continuous foundations is intended
to reduce or eliminate”fle poor performance of buildings or structures. This proposed amendment is a

Local Geotegig’Condition — Amendment is necessary on the basis of a local geologic condition. With the
higher seismic demand placed on buildings and structures in this region, interior walls can easily be called
upon to resist over half of the seismic loading imposed on simple buildings or structures. Without a
continuous foundation to support the braced wall line, seismic loads would be transferred through other
elements such as non-structural concrete slab floors, wood floors, etc. The change is to limit the use of the
exception to structures assigned to Seismic Design Category A, B or C where lower seismic demands are
expected. Requiring interior braced walls be supported by continuous foundations is intended to reduce or
eliminate the poor performance of buildings or structures. The amendment makes modification and changes
to better limit personal injury and property damage as a result of seismic activity and to establish criteria for
repair of damaged property following a local emergency.

Department of Development Services, Building and Safety Bureau and Code Enforcement Division Page 1 of 1
Fire Department, Fire Prevention Bureau Draft Version: 08/14/2016
City Manager, Office of Sustainability

49



THE 2017 PROPOSED AMENDMENTS TO THE LONG BEACH MUNICIPAL CODE

PROPOSED AMENDMENT:
Section 18.40.340 of the Long Beach Municipal Code is amended to read as follows:
18.40.340 — Amend CBC Section 2304-9-12304.10.1—Fastener requirements.

Section 2304-9-12304.10.1 of the 26432016 Edition of the California Building Code is amended to read
as follows:

2304-8-12304.10.1 Fastener requirements. Connections for wood members shall be designed in
accordance with the appropriate methodology in Section 2301.2. The number and size of fasteners
connecting wood members shall not be less than that set forth in Table 2304:9-42304.10.1. Staple
fasteners in Table 2304-9:12304.10.1 shall not be used to resist or transfer seismic forces in structures
assigned to Seismic Design Category D, E or F.

spsfer seismic forces when the allowable shear
dyved by the Building Official.

Exception: Staples may be used to resist &
values are substantiated by cyclic testing dnd a

RATIONALE:

Due to the high geologic activities in the thern California area and the expected higher level of
performance on buildings and stpuetures, thisroposed local amendment limit the use of staple fasteners
¥ September 2007, limited cyclic testing data was provided to
sfal Code Committee showing that stapled wood structural shear
panels do not exhibit the same bghgtior as the nailed wood structural shear panels. The test results of the

structural shear pan
forces shall not be 45

sv'Therefore, the use of staples as fasteners to resist or transfer seismic
itfiout being substantiated by cyclic testing. This proposed amendment is a

high geologic aCtivities in the Southern California area and the expected higher level of performance on
buildings and’structures, this amendment limit the use of staple fasteners in resisting or transferring seismic
forces. In September 2007, limited cyclic testing data was provided to the ICC Los Angeles Chapter
Structural Code Committee showing that stapled wood structural shear panels do not exhibit the same
behavior as the nailed wood structural shear panels. The test results of the stapled wood structural shear
panels appeared much lower in strength and drift than the nailed wood structural shear panel test results.
Therefore, the use of staples as fasteners to resist or transfer seismic forces shall not be permitted without
being substantiated by cyclic testing. The amendment makes modification and changes to better limit
personal injury and property damage as a result of seismic activity and to establish criteria for repair of
damaged property following a local emergency.

Department of Development Services, Building and Safety Bureau and Code Enforcement Division Page 1 of 1
Fire Department, Fire Prevention Bureau Draft Version: 08/14/2016
City Manager, Office of Sustainability

4



THE 2017 PROPOSED AMENDMENTS TO THE LONG BEACH MUNICIPAL CODE

PROPOSED AMENDMENT:
Section 18.40.350 of the Long Beach Municipal Code is amended to read as follows:
18.40.350 — Amend CBC Section 2308-12-52308.6.9—Attachment of sheathing.

Section 2308-12:52308.6.9 of the 26432016 Edition of the California Building Code is amended to read
as follows:

2308-12-62308.6.9 Attachment of sheathing. Fastening of braced wall panel sheathing shall not be less
than that prescribed in Tables 2308-12.42308.6.1 or 2304-8-42304.10.1. Wall sheathing shall not be
attached to framing members by adhesives. Staple fasteners in Table 2304-9-42304.10.1 shall not be
used to resist or transfer seismic forces in structures assigned to Seismic Design Category D, E or F.

ransfer seismic forces when the allowable shear
prroved by the Building Official.

Exception: Staples may be used to resist g
values are substantiated by cyclic testing ahq

All braced wall panels shall extend to the ¥02f sheathing and shall be attached to parallel roof rafters or
blocking above with framing clips (18 g inimum) spaced at maximum 24 inches (6096 mm) on

at each top corner and at maximum ofies (6096 mm) intervals along the top plate of discontinuous
vertical framing.
RATIONALE:

This proposed amendment s
are subject to the hi

gner g e m
@c miriendations by the Structural Engineers Association of Southern California
(SEAOSC) and tie Los Angeles City Joint Task Force that investigated the poor performance observed in
1994 Northridge ke. This proposed amendment is a continuation of an amendment adopted during
previous cod

Local Geologic Condition — Amendment is necessary on the basis of a local geologic condition. Due to the
high geologic activities in the Southern California area and the expected higher level of performance on
buildings and structures, this amendment limit the use of staple fasteners in resisting or transferring seismic
forces. In September 2007, limited cyclic testing data was provided to the ICC Los Angeles Chapter
Structural Code Committee showing that stapled wood structural shear panels do not exhibit the same
behavior as the nailed wood structural shear panels. The test results of the stapled wood structural shear
panels appeared much lower in strength and drift than the nailed wood structural shear panel test results.
Therefore, the use of staples as fasteners to resist or transfer seismic forces shall not be permitted without
being substantiated by cyclic testing. The amendment makes modification and changes to better limit
personal injury and property damage as a result of seismic activity and to establish criteria for repair of
damaged property following a local emergency.

Department of Development Services, Building and Safety Bureau and Code Enforcement Division Page 1 of 1
Fire Department, Fire Prevention Bureau Draft Version: 08/14/2016
City Manager, Office of Sustainability

4L



THE 2017 PROPOSED AMENDMENTS TO THE LONG BEACH MUNICIPAL CODE

PROPOSED AMENDMENT:
Section 18.65.010 of the Long Beach Municipal Code is amended to read as follows:

18.65.010 - Demolition of landmarks prohibited without building permit and funding for replacement
structure.

A. No permit to demolish a landmark or contributing structure designated pursuant to Chapter 2.63 of
this code may be issued by the Department unless: (1) a building permit has been issued for a
replacement structure or project for the property involved; and (2) the applicant has submitted
evidence to the satisfaction of the Planning-CommissionCultural Heritage Commission that a
financial commitment has been obtained by the applicant to assure the completion of the structure
or project.

B. Whenever, following action by the Planning-36 jonCultural Heritage Commission pursuant to
Subsection 18.65.010.A, a permit to derfig a landmark is either issued or denied by the
Department, the Director shall immedjatel y the applicant and the Cultural Heritage

Commission of such issuance.

RATIONALE:

ofs. The Ordinance mandates a Certificate of Appropriateness
is the same process to review changes for designated historical
t would bring this Section of Title 18 pertaining to demolition of historic
)pdated Cultural Heritage Ordinance by including the same process for

that this section of Title 18 is consistent with the Cuitural Heritage Ordinance, which protects historic
resources in the City. The administrative changes also correctly designate the hearing body that has
jurisdiction over the City’s historic resources.

Department of Development Services, Building and Safety Bureau and Code Enforcement Division Page 1 of 1 ,
Fire Department, Fire Prevention Bureau Draft Version: 08/02/2016 43 5
City Manager, Office of Sustainability



THE 2017 PROPOSED AMENDMENTS TO THE LONG BEACH MUNICIPAL CODE

PROPOSED AMENDMENT:
Section 21.15.025 is added to Chapter 21.15 of the Long Beach Municipal Code to read as follows:

21.15.025 — Terms Not Defined.

Where terms are not defined through the methods authorized by this section, such terms shall have
ordinarily accepted meanings such as the context implies. Webster's Third New International Dictionary
of the English Language, Unabridged shall be considered as providing ordinarily accepted meanings.

RATIONALE:

While Chapter 21.15 — Definitions, is intended to be as gémplete and comprehensive as possible. However,
situations arise where a definition is not included within¢Title 21, which hinders the ability to enforce zoning
and building regulations. The proposed language is rrrently used within the Definitions section of Title
18.

FINDINGS:

L.ocal Administrative Clarification — Amend }6 necessary for local administrative clarification, and does
not modify a Building Standard purs 0 Sections 17958, 17958.5 and 17958.7 of the California Health
and Safety Code. This amendm gdministrative changes to improve the ability to locate definitions
for zoning and building words.

Department of Development Services, Building and Safety Bureau and Code Enforcement Division Page 1 of 1
Fire Department, Fire Prevention Bureau Draft Version: 08/02/2016
City Manager, Office of Sustainability



THE 2017 PROPOSED AMENDMENTS TO THE LONG BEACH MUNICIPAL CODE

PROPOSED AMENDMENT:
Subsection 21.21.406.A of the Long Beach Municipal Code is amended to read as follows:
21.21.406 — Expiration.

A. Except as otherwise provided in the conditions of approval, every right or privilege authorized under
this Title shall terminate enetwo years after the granting of the request if the right or privilege has
not been exersised-in-good-faithcommenced within that two-year period. The termination will take
effect without further City action if a timely request for extension of time has not been made or is
denied. Any interruption or cessation necessitated by fire, flood, earthquake or act of war or
vandalism or cessation shall not result in the termination of the right or privilege.

RATIONALE:

The Zoning Ordinance includes a one-year exp{4tio ® for land use entitlements, such as Site Plan
Review, Conditional Use Permits, etc. Basgdon the comiplexity of the development environment, the
construction industry has frequently been uhdblesto commence construction or complete the plan review
process prior to the expiration date. Thig gsgitates the filing of a Time Extension application, which is
added time and expense for the applics Khis change would allow for a two-year period in which to
commence the project.

FINDINGS:

not modify a Buildin ard pyrsuant to Sections 17958, 17958.5 and 17958.7 of the California Health

até time to evaluate and process building construction plans to take into account the
ction environment in the City of Long beach, which includes, but is not limited

projects to have ad
complexities of the

Department of Development Services, Building and Safety Bureau and Code Enforcement Division Page 1 of 1
Fire Department, Fire Prevention Bureau Draft Version: 08/02/2016
City Manager, Office of Sustainability

45



THE 2017 PROPOSED AMENDMENTS TO THE LONG BEACH MUNICIPAL CODE

PROPOSED AMENDMENT:
Section 21.31.220.B.4 of the Long Beach Municipal Code is amended to read as follows:
4. SelarRooftop solar collectors and associated supporting structures may exceed the applicable

height limit only if necessary for the sole purpose of solar collection, and not otherwise installed on
any occupiable areas of the roof.

RATIONALE:
This clarifies that rooftop-mounted solar collectors may exceed the applicable height limit when installed on

non-occupiable areas of the roof. This eliminates ambiguity, as there are both occupiable and non-
occupiable areas of the roof.

FINDINGS:

Local Environmental Conditions — The Ci

gitched roof, roof decks), the blanket application of the height
6 and inconsistencies. The proposed modification clarifies that
solar collectors may only exceed gpplicable height limit when installed on a non-occupiable area of the
roof that may already be built to

Municipal Code.

Department of Development Services, Building and Safety Bureau and Code Enforcement Division Page 1 of 1
Fire Department, Fire Prevention Bureau Draft Version: 08/02/2016
City Manager, Office of Sustainability

4,



